The Asa Hutchinson Law Group, PLC

World Trade Center 3300 Market Street Suite 404 Rogers, Arkansas 72758 Tel: (479) 878-1600

Fax: (479) 878-1605

	Statement of Attorney Fees and Expenses	
		Hours
04/22/2010		
DAK	Interview regarding case facts	1.50
AH	Initial telephone conference from Bisbee; review statutes;	
	meeting in office to review facts	2.50
04/23/2010		
DAK	Continuation of interview; status update with Asa II; research	
	on suspension of public officials	2.80
AH	Office meeting with client to review facts; telephone	2.00
	conference with Van Stone; review file and law	1.40
AH	Telephone conference with David Bisbee on Stone discussion	0.30
04/26/2010		
	Call with Asa II and deliver letter to Judge Green	0.20
AH	Prepare Entry of Appearance; prepare letter to Judge Green;	
	communication with Van Stone, review case law and statutes;	FFILE
	telephone conference with client	1.30
04/27/2010		
AH	Telephone conference with client on judges' recusals; telephone	
	conference with Asa III on possible Bill of Information filing	0.40
04/29/2010		
AH	Telephone conference with Bisbee; telephone conference with	
	Gloria Peterson; telephone conference with Judge Finch;	
	communication with Administrative Office of Courts;	
	communication with Van Stone	1.00
05/03/2010		
AH	Research at UALR library on Acts of Arkansas and intent	
	issue	1.20
DAK	Call with Asa II regarding case; e-mail traffic with Van Stone	0.10
WAH		011.0
	correspondence with Van Stone regarding telephonic hearing	
	with Judge	0.30

05/04/2010		
AH	Meeting with Bisbee on facts and trial schedule; conference	
	call with Prosecuting Attorney and Judge Cole; meeting with	
DAK	Dak on issues; telephone conference to Bisbee on schedule	1.50
DAK	Conference with Asa II and Judge Bisbee regarding case; telephone hearing with Judge Cole and Van Stone	
	resolution use and	1.70
05/05/2010		
AH	Interview at Collector's office with Gloria Peterson;	
	meeting with client, research authority on prosecution	
	subpocnas; interview Gary and Jan Wierman; telephone	
	conference with Howard Slinkard	4.00
05/06/2010		
AH	Telephone conference from Bill Moutray, conference with	
	Dak on research; telephone conference back to Moutray	0.80
DAK	Phone call with County Attorncy and Asa II; work on	0.00
	prosecutor subpoena issue	0.50
05/07/0010		
05/07/2010 AH	Communication with Man St.	
All	Communication with Van Stone on status and delivery of discovery; receive and review Information; review 1 of 3	
	boxes in discovery; communication with client; begin draft of	
	Motion on subpoenas	2.20
DAK	Review of case file	0.60
05/08/2010		
AH	Review discovery from prosecutor's office; notes on witness	
	testimony; research on Motion to Quash	2.00
		2.00
05/09/2010		
AH	Draft Motion to Quash and Brief; continued review of	
	discovery material	3.80
05/10/2010		
AH	Interview of Howard Slinkard at his office, interview of Bill	
	Moutray at his office; meeting with Bisbee and review of	
	discovery; file Motion to Quash; communication to Judge	
	Cole; communication to Van Stone	5.50
DAK	Meeting with Asa II regarding issue of intent; meeting with	
AH	Asa II regarding division of labor	0.40
An	Research on Information charges and statutory history	1.00
0.0111.0010		
05/11/2010	Work on south a best of the state of the sta	
AH	Work on getting hearing with Judge Cole; telephone conference to Stone; telephone conference to Cole; follow-up	
	to cone; weepinde conterence to Cole; follow-up	

	communications on delivery of motion and brief; advise all parties on telephone hearing	1.20
05/12/2010		
DAK	Conference call with all parties regarding subpoena quash; call with Asa II regarding statute with forwarding e-mail	0.60
AH	Prepare for hearing with Judge Cole; conference call hearing on Motion to Quash; telephone conference to witness; additional research	1.10
05/12/2010		
05/13/2010 DAK	Call with Judge Bisbee regarding Motion to Quash; review of Prosecutor's Motion in Response; motion conference; call with Edens regarding meeting with Asa II	1.20
AH	Review Response of State on Motion for Protective Order, prepare for hearing; conference call with Judge Cole and all parties on motion; telephone conference to Bisbee, work on	1.20
	interviews	1.80
05/14/2010		
DAK	Research on intent Interview with Jim Eden; research on national cases involving	2.30
	"interest" and ethics violation; approve order on schedule	2.00
05/15/2010		
DAK AH	Research Arkansas Acts Work on Motion to Dismiss and brief including research on	1.00
	Count Six and due process argument	3.00
05/17/2010		
AH	Telephone conference with Jan Wierman; prepare Motion to Dismiss Counts One and Two	1.60
AH	Prepare Motion to Dismiss on Count Three; prepare Motion in Limine; prepare Motion to Strike Surplussage; go to UA Law Library to research original Acts of Arkansas and jury	1.50
	instructions	4.50
05/18/2010		
АН	Review and revise motions; prepare witness list; meeting with Bisbee on trial preparation; interview of Marsha Graham; telephone conference to Rocky Vantine; review witness list	2.50
	from state	3.50
05/19/2010 DAK AH	Review of motions and research on duplicity Prepare Motion to Dismiss Count 7; finalize filing of pleadings; communications with prosecutor's on witnesses;	0.50

	telephone conference from Finch office on hearing room;	
	meeting with client; review of witness list and facts: telephone	
	conference with Sid Phillippy on testimony	3.00
AH	Meeting with co-counsel on constitutional challenge and Attorney	
	General notice	0.30
05/20/2010		
05/20/2010		
DAK	Conference with Judge Bishee and Asa II; meeting with Asa II	
222	regarding motions hearing	0.80
AH	Work on pretrial hearing, meeting with client;	
	communications with Van Stone; receive and review new	
	round of discovery from State; prepare response to State's	
*****	discovery request	5.50
WAH	Prepare for pre-trial hearing	1.50
05/21/2010		
DAK	Mations baseline of the second	
DAK	Motions hearing preparation and attendance, research on	
AH	Statutory interpretation	4.00
ALL	Preparation for Pre-trial hearing; attend and argue at Pre-trial	
	hearing on motions; follow-up research and attend afternoon session	
WAH		5.00
WILL	Pre-trial hearing; research regarding same	2.50
05/24/2010		
DAK	Case strategy meeting with Asa II and Asa III; cover letter to	
	clerk for subpoenas	0.00
AH	Telephone conference with Van Stone on new and unknown	0.80
	Amended Information; work on new charges; interview with	
	witness, Rocky Vantine; telephone conference with Jan	
	Wierman; telephone conference with T. Pockrus; work	
	with Asa III on new subpoena for Linda Bisbee	3.20
WAH	Trial preparation	1.00
WAH	Draft Motion to Quash Subpocna of Linda Bisbee; research	1.00
	regarding same	2.00
		2.00
05/25/2010		
DAK	Call with Bisbee regarding subpoenas; call with Slinkard	
	regarding interview; status e-mail to Asa II; advertising issue;	
	research on intent	1.30
AH	Telephone conference with McComas; telephone conference	
	with Asa III on Motion to Quash Subpoena; review draft of	
	Motion and Brief; review Asa III's proposed jury instructions	0.80
AH	Telephone conference with Bisbee on subpoena and Motion to	- 77
	Quash; telephone conference with Asa III	0.60
WAH	Revise Motion to Quash Linda Bisbcc's Subpoena and Brief in	
	Support	1.30
WAH	Telephone conference with Bill Moutnay regarding testimony	0.20

WAH	Draft jury instructions for Counts 1 - III and VI; research	
	regarding same	1.50
05/26/2010		
DAK	Witness letter; review of Motion to Quash; strict liability	
THAT	research; e-mail to Asa III regarding research	1.10
WAH	Revise jury instructions for Counts I, II and VI; correspondence to Van Stone regarding Linda Bisbee	
	subpoena; review Response to Motion to Quash Linda Bisbee	
	Subpoena	0.70
WAH	Research regarding mens rea elements of charges	0.40
05/27/2010		
DAK	Conference with Asa II regarding intent research	0.20
AH	Prepare trial outline and witness outlines	1.50
WAH	Telephone conference with George Spence regarding waiver	
WALL	of privilege	0.20
WAH	Telephone conferences with D. Bisbee and L. Bisbee	0.30
WAII	Telephone conference with Judge Cole regarding Motion to Quash L. Bisbee's subpoena	0.20
WAII	Telephone conference with Teresa Pockrus regarding	0.20
	testimony	0.20
WAH	Preparation for Linda Bisbee Prosecutor's Subpoena	0.80
WAH	Email to George Spence regarding testimony and	
	attorncy-client privilege	0.40
05/28/2010		
DAK	Discussion with Asa II regarding fax; call with R. Garner,	
	meeting with Asa II and Bisbcc; e-mail to Barclay	1.80
AH	Prepare for witness interviews; meeting with Jim Edens;	
	meeting with Rich McComas; meeting with Dave Bisbee;	
	telephone conference to Stone on exhibits; telephone conference from Stone on new material	2.40
AH	Telephone conference from George Spence; review Ordinance	3.40
-	from Tena O'Brien	0.30
05/29/2010		
DAK	Delivery of discovery; meeting with Asa II	0.60
AH	Trial preparation including witness question preparation;	0.00
	review new material from prosecution; prepare trial notebook;	
	work on exhibits	7.20
05/30/2010		
AH	Trial preparation including work on jury instructions; opening	
	statement and exhibits; telephone conference to Tom Allen	3.00

05/31/2010		
DAK	Meeting with Asa II regarding opening statements, research on hearsay exception with notice to state, case work with Asa II	
	and Bisbees	3.50
06/01/2010		
AH	Early trial preparation; first day of jury trial including jury selection, motions and opening statements; late night trial work continued	
DAK	First day of jury trial and jury selection	10.00
WAH	Attend trial; trial preparation	8.00 10.50
06/02/2010		
AH	Second day of trial and after hours work on jury instructions	
DAY	and witnesses	10.00
DAK WAH	Second day of jury trial	8.00
WAH	Total Control of the Property of the Control of the	4.50
WAII	Review audio recordings of Committee of Thirteen meetings;	
WAH	prepare transcripts regarding same	1.00
WAH	Research regarding jury instructions for elements of charges	2.50
06/03/2010		
AH	Third day of jury trial and continued work on jury instructions and witnesses	12.00
DAK	Third day of jury trial	12.00
WAH	Trial and preparation for same	8.00
	and proposition for saide	12.00
06/04/2010		
AH	Fourth day of trial; conclusion of defense case; closing	
DAK	arguments and jury verdict	10.50
WAH	Fourth day of jury trial Trial	10.00
WAII	ITIAL	9.50
06/05/2010		
WAH	Research regarding jury contact and procedures for re-trying Count II	0.80
06/07/2010		
AH	Telephone conference to Judge Cole on jury inquiry;	
	telephone conference with client; attempted calls to jury	
	members	0.50
		0,50
06/09/2010		
AH	Prepare petition for attorney fees and brief	0.80

06/15/2010 AH	Research post trial motions as option; research speedy trial issues on Count 2	0.50	
06/16/2010 AH	Telephone conference from Bishee on next steps on Count 2	0.30	
06/24/2010			
DAK	Call from Judge Bisbee regarding status of case; follow-up e-mail to Asa, Sr.	0.40	
06/28/2010			
AH	Prepare letter to Judge Cole; telephone conference from Stone on next steps on case	0.70 242.8	72,332.50

T	imekeeper	Hours	Rate	Total
Asa Hutchinson		126.60	\$400.00	\$50,640.00
V	V. Asa Hutchinson III	54.30	200.00	10,860.00
D	ruane A. Kees	61.90	175.00	10,832.50
	Costs			
)5/24/2010	Benton County Circuit Clerk charges re Jury Question	nnaires		15.00
15/26/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Judge John Scott			30.00
15/27/2010	Certified mailing charges for return receipt requested,	restricted		
	delivery to witnesses			150.60
15/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Kurt Moore			37.40
15/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Richard Barclay			31.55
15/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Reese Gamer			31.90
15/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Tom Allen			31.50
05/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Darrell Wheeler			60.75
15/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Howard Slinkard			31.88
15/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Rocky Vantine			31.88
35/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Bill Moutray			30.00
05/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Jan Wierman			33.70
05/27/2010	Witness/mileage fee re Gary Wierman			33.70
16/01/2010	Cohen Copeland Court Reporting invoice regarding t	ranscript		65.60
36/03/2010	Cohen Copeland Court Reporting invoice for transcri	ipt of State's		

2715749 :

20/ 21

06/21/2010	Onference calls on 5/12 and 5/13	82.00 14.89
Total Costs		712.35
Total Time (Charges	72,332.50

Balance due: \$73,044.85