
From: Cassie Cantlon
To: James Caldwell (TSS)
Cc: Jason Hogland
Bcc: cassiecantlon@gmail.com
Subject: FW: 0034 Deposit
Date: Friday, September 15, 2023 8:07:00 AM
Attachments: 0034-Deposit.pdf
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Good morning, James and Jason,
 
The attached deposit was brought to me late yesterday afternoon, 9.14.23 from Laura Hamilton at
the Governor’s Office. This is a check from the Republican Party of Arkansas to reimburse the
podium purchase in June 2023 for $19,029.25 on the State p-card. Laura was instructed for either
our office or herself to make a note on the original invoice that it was “to be reimbursed”. As you
can see on the attachment, she made the note. I asked if she wanted to date the note and she
stated that she was told not to date it, but to just make the note that the invoice was to be
reimbursed. I also told her that they would not be getting any appropriation back for this and she
indicated that she already told Judd Deere the same thing so they are aware.
 
This email serves as my documentation to both of you what happened and the reason for this
deposit.
 
Thank you,
 

 
Cassie Cantlon | Administrative Services Manager
Transformation and Shared Services
o. 501.319.6554 | cassie.cantlon@arkansas.gov
Website | Facebook | Twitter | LinkedIn | Instagram

 
 

From: Ta'Lun Campbell <TaLun.Campbell@arkansas.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, September 14, 2023 4:01 PM
To: Cassie Cantlon <Cassie.Cantlon@arkansas.gov>
Subject: 0034 Deposit
 
Cassie,
 
Attached is the deposit for 0034.
 
Best regards,
 

Ta’Lun Campbell
Business Operation Account Specialist
Transformation and Shared Services

mailto:Cassie.Cantlon@arkansas.gov
mailto:James.Caldwell.DIS@arkansas.gov
mailto:Jason.Hogland@arkansas.gov
mailto:cassiecantlon@gmail.com
mailto:cassie.cantlon@arkansas.gov
http://www.transform.ar.gov/
http://www.facebook.com/ArkansasTSS
http://www.twitter.com/ArkansasTSS
https://www.linkedin.com/company/department-of-transformation-and-shared-services/
http://www.instagram.com/ArkansasTSS
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Payment receipt


to Becketl Events LLC on 617212O23


lnvoice no.


lnvoice amount


Total


No additional transfer fees or taxes apply


Status


Payment method


Authorization lD


Thank you
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$19,029.25


$19,029.25


paid


Credit Card


ARUKOASB97973887
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BCCKCIt EVENTS LLC


virginia@ beckettevents.com
2116 Zts| Rd N,, Arlington,YA2220L


Payment services brought by:
lntuit Payments lnc.


2700 Coast Avenue. Mountain View, CA
94043


Phone number 1-888-536-4801


NrvLS #L098819


For more intormation about lntuit
Payments' money transmission licenses.


please visit
https://ww,v. intuit.com/leo al/licenses/oavment-


licenses/.


You paid $19,029.25
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Beckd Events LLC


2116 21st Rd N,


^dington, 
VA 22201 US


+12672101933


viBini6@becketlevenG com
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BILL TO


Offce ofthe Govemor ofArkansas
5O0 Woodlane Sheet


Sune 250


Litte Rock, Arknsas 72201


DATE


06/082023


INVOICE


06t08t2423


INVOICE


DATE


TER]\/1S


OUE DATE


1071


06rc8/2023


Due on aeceipt


06tu8/2023


QTY RqTE


18,475.00


Services


AMOUNT


18,475.00


554.25


$19,029.25


DESCRIPTlON


Cuslom Falcon Podium
3Slndt Custrm Falcon Podium
Custom Podium Road Case
Taxes and Shipping


37o CreditCard Processing Fee


BALANCE DUE
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Paymentby Che.k Wire. o. ACH is p.eferred-


( t{.h


22600607CA92
Rort ng Number:


054001204 (ACH)
026009593 (s/ re)


Services


Bankng lnforma:ion:


5201 WisconsinAve.. NW
U/ as hington. D C 2Cr015
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REPUBLICAN PARTY OF ARKANSAS
SPECIAL PROJECTS ACCOUNI 1


PH.479-531-3430
1201 W 6TH ST


LTTTLE ROCK, AR 72201-3019
q /u /zs


1029


a,!-431a29DATE


PAY TO THE tl"k "l A-t^ *,ORDEH O $ vqon.2f,


Slmmons Bank
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tt cHLCK BEeF FO;1 MOBTLE OR t1€MOTE DEFOSTT ONLY


Th IS LINE











Office: 501-682-4913
talun.campbell@arkansas.gov
EPIC Service

 
 

mailto:talun.campbell@arkansas.gov

